
EXTRAORDINARY THINGS TO SEE AND DO!

SAN FRANCISCO

SAVE TIME & MONEY
 BY ADDING THE FUN TODAY!
Please ask your travel advisor for live pricing and availability

This live narrated 60–90-minute tour takes you around the most vibrant
neighborhoods of San Francisco. Enjoy the panoramic views of the city from an
open-top Double Decker bus, cross the sparkling Bay Bridge and see the San
Francisco skyline at twilight from Treasure Island.

The Go City: San Francisco Explorer Pass gives you access to your choice of 2, 3, 4
or 5 top San Francisco attractions for one low price. It is the best choice for
maximum savings and flexibility and will save you up to a massive 59% off the
combined individual entry prices for the attractions of your choice!

Operating since 1939, there is no better way to experience San Francisco's historic
landmarks and skyline that a relaxing Bay Cruise. This hour long sightseeing cruise
will take you past Alcatraz and under the Golden Gate Bridge. On route, discover
San Francisco's history and world famous landmarks through personal headphone
audio in 12 languages.

The Go City: San Francisco All-Inclusive Pass offers maximum savings and
flexibility when visiting San Francisco. With over 25 featured attractions you can
create your ideal San Francisco itinerary based on what you like to do. Featured
attractions include the California Academy of Science, San Francisco Bay Cruise,
Aquarium of the Bay, Exploratorium, and much more!

See San Francisco up close and personal as you cycle around the city by bike.
Enjoy the freedom of exploring at your own pace and discover ‘back road’ gems
as well as established highlights such as Golden Gate Park, the Presidio,
Fisherman’s Wharf, the Golden Gate Bridge and much more.

Guaranteed admission to one of San Fran's best-loved attractions with a pre-
purchased Madame Tussauds Ticket. Use your ticket to star in immersive
experiences and get up close to more than 150 lifelike figures of your favourite
celebrities.

Picture this: the California sun gracefully bidding farewell, casting its warm glow
over the Pacific Ocean, framed by the iconic Golden Gate – a moment that has
witnessed countless proposals, a testament to its romantic allure.

A bike tour is a fun and relaxed way to explore San Francisco’s Waterfront District
culminating in the chance to ride over the world famous Golden Gate Bridge to
sunny Sausalito.

Much more than a city tour, your All Loops ticket offers the chance to discover San
Francisco at your own pace and get a real flavour of the city. Hop on and off at any
of the convenient stops giving you the freedom and flexibility to see the sights
before jumping on to the next bus to continue your tour.

Take this Electric Bike Tour over San Francisco's famed hills and by the end of the
tour know' Frisco' like a local!

San Francisco Self-Guided Bike Tour (One Day's Rental)

California Sunset Cruise on San Francisco Bay

Go City: San Francisco Explorer Pass

Go City: San Francisco All-Inclusive Pass

Madame Tussauds San Francisco

Streets of San Francisco 'Electric' Bike Tour

Hop-on Hop-Off Double Decker Bus Tour of San Francisco

Golden Gate Bay Sightseeing Cruise

San Francisco Night Tour

Golden Gate Bridge to Sausalito

From
€84 Adult
€79 Child

From
€31

From
€37 Adult
€28 Child

From
€49 Adult
€37 Child

From
€66 Adult
€52 Child

From
€36 Adult
€24 Child

From
€81 Adult
€57 Child

From
€82

From
€45 Adult
€36 Child

From
€72 Adult
€61 Child


