
EXTRAORDINARY THINGS TO SEE AND DO!

ICELAND

SAVE TIME & MONEY
 BY ADDING THE FUN TODAY!
Please ask your travel advisor for live pricing and availability

Feel the freedom on top of a glacier with a one hour snowmobile ride on
Langjökull glacier and take the adventure of a lifetime on the popular Golden
Circle tour.

See three exceptional Icelandic sights - Thingvellir National Park, Geysir
geothermal area and Gullfoss waterfall on one itinerary on on this incredible
Super Jeep tour where you will immerse yourself in the country's nature, geology
and history while taking some impressive photos!

The Golden Circle Direct, is one of the most popular Icelandic tours, visiting the
world-famous Geysir geothermal area and Gullfoss before moving on to visit
Thingvellir National Park.

Set in the heart of the Icelandic landscape, no trip to Iceland would be complete
without a visit to the unique Blue Lagoon geothermal spa!

This Northern Lights tour takes you in a SuperJeep from Reykjavik, far from the
city lights, to observe this fascinating natural phenomenon also known as Aurora
Borealis.

The Northern Lights tour in Iceland takes you to see a spectacular natural
phenomenon which happens during the winter months.

Step into the warm waters, breathe in the refreshing ocean air and float through a
breathtaking canyon as you enjoy the magnificent view over the Atlantic Ocean.

This action-packed excursion lets you explore three different Icelandic volcanoes in
one just one day! After driving through some of Iceland’s most photogenic
countryside, you will head off on rough mountain tracks to the foot of Mount Hekla,
the most active volcano in the country.

With their colourful beaks and playful demeanour, Puffins are often called the
'clown of the sea' and you can see these delightful birds perform, up close and
personal, on this charming cruise.

Iceland's rich variety of sealife includes Harbour porpoises, white-beaked dolphins
and, of course, an abundance of whales. See how many you can spot on this sea
safari extravaganza!

Northern Lights by SuperJeep

Sky Lagoon Pass With Return Transfers

Golden Circle & Langjokull Glacier by SuperJeep

Blue Lagoon Admission - Comfort or Premium Experience

Northern Lights Tour in Iceland

Whale Watching Iceland

Puffin Watching from Reykjavik

Golden Circle Direct Iceland

Golden Circle & Glacier Snowmobiling

Volcano Hat-trick by SuperJeep

From
€156

From
€53 Adult
€27 Youth

From
€67 Adult
€33 Youth

From
€125 Adult
€62 Youth

From
€319 Adult
€159 Child

From
€218 Adult
€109 Child

From
€395 Adult
€198 Child

From
€92 Adult
€45 Child

From
€201 Adult
€100 Youth

From
€50 Adult
€25 Child


